
From: nickie bailey
Sent: Thursday, April 25, 2019 8:53:49 PM
To: Ledyardllpresident@yahoo.com <Ledyardllpresident@yahoo.com>
Cc: Robert Russak; grumpy001@comcast.net 
<grumpy001@comcast.net>
Subject: Water Bills

 

Kristen,

Here is the information 

April/May 110.00. Total gallons 320
May/June 110.00. Total gallons  1150
June/July 832.69 Total gallons  58 050
July/August  854.36 Total gallons 54100
August/September  2083.01 Total gallons  131900
September/October  583.01 Total gallons  124800
October/November  61.69 Total gallons  3900
November/December  38.69 Total gallons  2450

Sorry for the email on my phone.  Nikolas has to finish the yearbook. 

Any questions let me know. Thanks 
Get Outlook for Android

From: Robert Russak <plankowner21@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 23, 2016 7:58:55 PM
To: Don Grise <don@ledyardrec.org>
Cc: Nickie Bailey (Home) <nickbailey@live.com>; Bailey, Nickie G 
<NGBailey@ifgcompanies.com>; Karen Crawford 
<grumpy001@comcast.net>
Subject: WPCA Meeting

 

Good Evening Don, (Probably be Morning when you get this)
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I just got home from the WPCA meeting.  The council was adamant that they 
would not commit for the rate payers wouldn't to absorb the cost, I think we 
knew that already.  All members were in agreement that having a Non-Profit 
paying a utility bill was probably a mistake.  They stated that they would be 
discussing at the next town council moving the billing from LYL to the Parks and 
Recreation, and ensuring that the town was involved in that discussion.  LYL has 
the capacity to pay for our use and I don't want anyone believing that we're 
trying to shirk our responsibility to pay a reasonable fee for water.  This event is 
considerably unreasonable and not necessarily something we could have 
anticipated.  Would you know when the next town council meeting is?  I'd like to 
attend so as to answer questions anyone might have regarding the Youth 
League.


It was suggested, that until it is determined the method for which the total sum 
of the water bill from June through August totals, the Youth League pay an 
amount equivalent to our average last summer during the high water use 
months.  Groton Utilities had a representative at the WPCA meeting and he was 
in agreement.  The highest month in 2015 ran us $222.58 and the 3 month 
average June through September was $211.24.


-- 

Respectfully,

Rob Russak

LYL President 

From: Carrington, John <JCarrington@groton-ct.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 17, 2012 2:53:41 PM

To: nickie bailey (nickbailey@live.com) <nickbailey@live.com>; 
EBDON, DREW A PW <drew.ebdon@pw.utc.com>; John and Karen 
Crawford (grumpy001@comcast.net) <grumpy001@comcast.net>; 
WENDY LEYKO (wendy.s.sanders-leyko@bankofamerica.com) 
<wendy.s.sanders-leyko@bankofamerica.com>
Subject: FW: Water Bills

 

See below Don suggest we pay the bill.


-----Original Message-----
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From: Don Grise [don@ledyardrec.org] 

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2012 2:52 PM

To: Carrington, John

Subject: RE: Water Bills


John

     Just got a call from Groton Water, they checked everything out and 
no leaks any place, they checked it this past Friday and today.   1,800 
gals were used over the weekend which I assume you had a game. I 
talked to Paul earlier in the day and he turned the irrigations system off 
this past Thursday.  I would suggest you pay the bill. Grise


-----Original Message-----

From: Carrington, John [JCarrington@groton-ct.gov] 

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2012 10:43 AM

To: Don Grise

Subject: RE: Water Bills


$583.19


Previous bill was $155.03


-----Original Message-----

From: Don Grise [don@ledyardrec.org] 

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2012 10:42 AM

To: Carrington, John

Subject: RE: Water Bills


Just curious, how much was the bill. 


-----Original Message-----

From: Carrington, John [JCarrington@groton-ct.gov] 

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2012 10:33 AM

To: Don Grise

Subject: Re: Water Bills


Does that mean we should pay the bill for the 84,000 gallons?


mailto:don@ledyardrec.org
mailto:JCarrington@groton-ct.gov
mailto:don@ledyardrec.org
mailto:JCarrington@groton-ct.gov


----- Original Message -----

From: Don Grise [don@ledyardrec.org]

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2012 10:31 AM

To: Carrington, John

Subject: RE: Water Bills


Water for the irrigation system is off and 6 large trash cans are on the 
way. Grise


-----Original Message-----

From: Carrington, John [JCarrington@groton-ct.gov] 

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2012 6:44 AM

To: Don Grise

Subject: RE: Water Bills


Don, What should we do about paying the bill? John


-----Original Message-----

From: Don Grise [don@ledyardrec.org] 

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2012 9:21 AM

To: Carrington, John

Subject: RE: Water Bills


Old water system is off, Groton utilities is checking. Grise


-----Original Message-----

From: Carrington, John [JCarrington@groton-ct.gov] 

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2012 6:43 AM

To: Don Grise

Subject: RE: Water Bills


Don, What did you find?  John


-----Original Message-----

From: Don Grise [don@ledyardrec.org] 

Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2012 10:56 AM

To: Carrington, John

Subject: RE: Water Bills
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Thanks  we are currently checking to make sure the old system is off. 
Will let you know. grise


-----Original Message-----

From: Carrington, John [JCarrington@groton-ct.gov] 

Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2012 8:45 AM

To: Don Grise

Subject: Water Bills


Don, 

Most recent bill says we have used 84,050 gallons in one month. 
Unless the sprinkler system uses over 2000 gallons a day, I think we 
have a problem again.

John


-----Original Message-----

From: john-carrington@sbcglobal.net [john-carrington@sbcglobal.net] 

Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2012 8:42 AM

To: Carrington, John

Subject: Fw:


Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry


-----Original Message-----

From: Nickie Bailey <Nickie.Bailey@nlcinsurance.com>

Date: Tue, 11 Sep 2012 08:30:49 

To: 'john-carrington@sbcglobal.net'<john-carrington@sbcglobal.net>

Subject: FW: 


Hi John,


Does this water bill look right to you?  Could we have used 84,050 
gallons of water since 7/26/12 when the last reading was taken?
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Thanks

Nickie


-----Original Message-----

From: scanner_perslines@nlcinsurance.com 
[scanner_perslines@nlcinsurance.com] 

Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2012 8:20 AM

To: Nickie Bailey

Subject: 


This E-mail was sent from "RNP11463C" (Aficio MP 4001).


Scan Date: 09.11.2012 08:20:10 (-0400)

Queries to: scanner_perslines@nlcinsurance.com

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~

NOTICE: This email message is for the sole use of the intended 
recipient(s) and may contain 

confidential and privileged information.  Any unauthorized review, use, 
disclosure or distribution 

is prohibited.  If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the 
sender by reply email 

and destroy all copies of the original message.
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