

Town Attorney Expenditures- FY26 YT

7/1/25-6/30/26

Invoice Date	Date of work	Hours	Expenditure
8/19/2025	7/14/2025	1.5 hrs	\$712.50
9/8/2025	8/19/2025	.2 hrs	\$59.00
	8/26/2025	1.4 hrs	\$413.00
	8/27/2025	1.5 hrs	\$442.50
	8/28/2025	1.8 hrs	\$531.00
	8/29/2025	2.0 hrs	\$590.00
10/3/2025	8/26/2025	.4 hrs	\$118.00
	9/4/2025	1.5 hrs	\$442.50
	9/9/2025	2.0 hrs	\$590.00
	9/10/2025	2.0 hrs	\$590.00
	9/15/2025	.2 hrs	\$59.00
	9/23/2025	.3 hrs	\$88.50
11/14/2025	9/10/2025	.3 hrs	\$88.50
	10/1/2025	0.1	\$29.50
	10/3/2025	1.1	\$324.50
	10/6/2025	0.2	\$59.00
	10/8/2025	0.7	\$206.50
	10/9/2025	0.5	\$147.50
	10/13/2025	1.6	\$472.00
	10/15/2025	1.2	\$354.00
	10/21/2025	1	\$295.00
	10/22/2025	3.5	\$1,032.50
	10/27/2025	2.5	\$737.50
	10/28/2025	1.5	\$442.50
	10/29/2025	0.5	\$147.50
	10/31/2025	0.4	\$118.00
3/13/2026	1/14/2026	0.3	\$88.50
	1/14/2026	0.2	\$59.00
	1/14/2026	0.3	\$88.50
	1/21/2026	0.1	\$29.50
	1/22/2026	0.4	\$118.00
	-	-	-
	1/22/2026	0.3	\$88.50
	2/3/2026	0.2	\$59.00
	-	-	-
	2/6/2026	0.6	\$177.00
	2/7/2026	4	\$1,180.00

2/8/2026	1.1	\$324.50
2/9/2026	1.9	\$560.50
2/10/2026	0.9	\$265.50
-	-	-
2/13/2026	0.1	\$29.50
2/13/2026	0.2	\$59.00
2/16/2026	0.5	\$147.50
2/17/2026	0.1	\$29.50
2/17/2026	1.1	\$324.50
-	-	-
2/17/2026	1.2	\$354.00
-	-	-
2/18/2026	0.5	\$147.50
-	-	-
2/19/2026	0.6	\$177.00
-	-	-
2/20/2026	0.1	\$29.50
2/23/2026	1.2	\$354.00
		<u>\$13,781.00</u>
thru January 26		<u>\$11,315.50</u>
		\$25,096.50

D

Project

Continued editing draft Code of Ethics / Ethics Commission

Review comms for alleged past due invoice, confer
Conf. call w/client re: Insalco demand, strategize, draft memo
Review client docs, conduct legal research to support position
Confer w/ atty Ritter, work strategies, next steps, prepare settlement
Draft comm. To Insalco and SP+A, concerning Insalco demand

call w/ Mayor re: Insalco unpaid claims from LMS project
Review client docs, and comms, prepare letter to Insalco and SP+A
Review claim w/ client, SP+A, review closeout process, research process
Finalize letters to Insalco, SP+A w/ attachments. Send certified
Review comms w/ SP+A, send to client, prep response
Communicate w/ Insalco re: settlement, fwd to client w/ notes, prep release

Conversation w/ Mayor re: legal matters
Vendor dispute w/ LMS project
Vendor dispute w/ LMS project
Vendor dispute w/ LMS project
Review Charter re: Ethics Ordinance/ Code
Communicate w/ Council re: Ordinance disapproval
Review and comment on Ethics Ordinance
Respond to various email questions about disapproval
Research and respond to Council Chair re: FOIA matter
Prepare for and attend Town Council meeting (Zoom)
Review and edit draft Ethics ordinance
Correspondance w/ J. Buhle re: Ethics and amendments
Correspondance w/ Councilors re Ethics Ord / review amendments
Review edits to Ethics Ordinance

Review and analyze FOIC complaint
Confer w/ Atty. Ritter re: FOIC complaint
Draft and file FOIC appearance, update client regarding same
Follow up strategy call w/ Atty. Ritter re: FOIC complaint
Correspondance w/ FOI Ombudsman re: poss. withdrawal of
complaint and recent actions to disapprove Ethics Ordinance
Review ombudsman response, update cleint next steps
Email w/ Councilor G-Irizarry re: Ethics Ordinance and process to
amend the same
Correspondance and review re: Ethics Ordinance appendix
Review and edit latest version of Ethics Ordinance

Continued review and editing of Ethics Ordinance
Conference call w/ Councilors to discuss Ethics Ord., edit same
Respond to Council questions re: fixing compensation for non-
classified employees, review Town Charter re: same
Email follow up with FOI ombudsman re: training, poss. withdraw
Email correspondance w/ client re: training and next steps
Review and respond to Council budget questions
Correspondance w/ FOI Ombudsman re: hearing status
Review FOIC statutes, commission decision, advise Chair on
possible next steps and hearing outcomes
Email correspondance re: salary matter for positions not in
classified service, review Town Charter re: same
Correspondance re: salaries for non-classified employees and
authority for the Town Council to adjust the same
continued correspondance re: salaries for non-classified
employees and authority for Town Council to adjust same.
Correspondance w/ Council Chair re: hearing attendance.
Review 5 FOIC decisions re: 24 hr notice rule, CGS 1-225. Hearing prep

Ledyard vs. Imperial Roofing (GFS Roof- PV project legal dispute, not itemized here)

Town Attorney expenditures through 2/23/26

Department

Town Council

BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC

BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC

Mayor

BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC
BoE - PMBC

Town Council
Town Council

Town Council
Town Council
Town Council
Town Council
Town Council

-
Town Council
Town Council

-
Town Council
Town Council

Town Council
Town Council
Town Council

-

Town Council
Town Council
Town Council
Town Council
Town Council

-

Town Council

-

Town Council

-

Town Council

-

Town Council
Town Council

Boe- PMBC